
 

4. Additions to the last newsletter (2/2023) – 
Modifications in classified products in the IDTF 
N° 
IDTF 

Product name Modifications 
Cleaning 
regime 

Publication 
date 

Mandatory 
from 

1004
6 

(Compound 
feed containing) 
Fishmeal 
intended to be 
used for the 
feeding of non-
ruminant farmed 
animals 
(including 
aquaculture 
animals) except 
unweaned 
ruminants” 

Change product name to 
“Fishmeal and compound 
feeds containing fishmeal 
(except milk replacers for 
the feeding of unweaned 
ruminants)” 
 
Add “Marine annelid meal 
(10.6.1)”, “Marine 
zooplankton meal 
(10.7.1)”, “Marine 
invertebrates meal 
(10.11.1)” to Related 
products 
 
Removed “meal from 
farmed marine annelid”, 
“meal from farmed marine 
zooplankton”, “krill protein 
concentrate processed 
according to Annex X, 
Chapter II, Section 1, b3 of 
Reg. (EU) No 142/2011” 
from Related products 

List of 
differences 

23-10-2023 23-10-2023 

10119 
 

Processed 
animal protein 
(PAP), derived 
from non-
ruminants other 
than: 
aquaculture 
animals, farmed 
insects, porcine 
animals, poultry 
and compound 
feed containing 
these products 

Add “Processed animal 
protein (non-ruminants 
other than aquaculture 
animals, farmed insects, 
porcine animals and 
poultry) (9.4.1)”, “Greaves 
(non-ruminants other than 
aquaculture animals, 
farmed insects, porcine 
animals and poultry) 
(9.13.1)”, “Blood meal 
(non-ruminants other than 
porcine animals and 
poultry) (9.7.1)” to Related 
products 
 
Removed “Hair meal 
derived from non-
ruminants other than 
porcine animals”, “Horse 
meal”, “Blood meal 
derived from non-

List of 
differences 

23-10-2023 23-10-2023 



 

 

N° 
IDTF 

Product name Modifications 
Cleaning 
regime 

Publication 
date 

Mandatory 
from 

ruminants other than 
porcine animals and 
poultry”, “Greaves meal 
derived from non-
ruminants other than 
porcine animals and 
poultry” from Related 
products 

10152 Processed 
animal protein 
(PAP) derived 
from ruminants 
intended for use 
in feedingstuffs, 
or compound 
feed containing 
these products 

Add “Processed animal 
protein (ruminants) (9.4.1)” 
to Related products 
 
Removed “Beef meal”, 
“lamb meal”, “sheep 
meal”, “deer meal”, 
“reindeer meal”; “meat 
meal”, “animal meal”, 
“bone meal derived from 
ruminants”, “hair meal 
derived from ruminants” to 
Related products 

List of 
differences 

23-10-2023 23-10-2023 

10175 Processed 
animal protein 
(PAP) derived 
from porcine 
animals and 
compound feed 
containing these 
products 

Add “Processed animal 
protein (porcine animals) 
(9.4.1)” to Related 
products 
 
Removed “Hair meal 
derived from porcine 
animals”, “Pork meal” from 
Related products 

List of 
differences 

23-10-2023 23-10-2023 

10177 Processed 
animal protein 
(PAP) derived 
from poultry and 
compound feed 
containing these 
products 

Add “Processed animal 
protein (poultry) (9.4.1) )”, 
“Feather meal (9.11.1)”, 
“Greaves (poultry) 
(9.13.1)” to Related 
products 
 
Removed “Poultry meat 
meal”, “Poultry meat bone 
meal derived from 
Category 3 materials” from 
Related products 

List of 
differences 

23-10-2023 23-10-2023 

10178 Processed 
animal protein 
(PAP) derived 
from farmed 
insects and 
compound feed 
containing these 
products 

Add “Processed animal 
protein (farmed insects) 
(9.4.1)” to Related 
products 
 
Removed “Meal derived 
from farmed insects” from 
Related products 

List of 
differences 

23-10-2023 23-10-2023 


